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     The Artists Collective | Spartanburg in 
Spartanburg, SC, will present its Annual 
Holiday Artisan Market, on view in the 
Solomon Gallery, from Nov. 8 through Dec. 
23, 2023. In addition, ArtWalk Spartanburg, 
will be held on Nov. 16 and Dec. 21, from 
6-8pm.
     Looking ahead at the holidays, do you 
often think you’d like to give unique gifts 
– one-of-a-kind pieces that the recipient 
will really cherish? Sure, there are websites 
offering such items, but why not “shop lo-
cal” at the Artists Collective | Spartanburg’s 
2023 Holiday Artisan Market?
      “This much-anticipated annual market 
will feature works of 44 regional artists’ 
works – everything from acrylic paintings 
to sculptures and jewelry to photography 
and ceramics and just about everything in 
between,” says Marcy Fedalei, one of the 
artists and a member of the Holiday Artisan 
Market Committee. “Every piece is original 
and unique, and sure to please any recipient, 
and while you’re at it, pick up something – 
or a few things – for yourself.” Prices of the 
art will range from under $5 to more than 
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Works by Nancy Williamson

Work by Rosemary McLeod

     Artists Collective | Spartanburg, SC, will 
present Heart Forward: The Resurrection of 
Love, featuring works by Lady Pluuto, from 
Nov. 7 through Dec. 2, 2023. A reception 
will be held on Nov. 16, from 5-8pm, during 
the Spartanburg ArtWalk. 
     Upstate artist Lady Pluuto believes in the 
strength of people’s hearts, and she is show-
ing her belief in a new exhibition of digital 
painting.
     “These digital paintings portray a pivotal 
moment where the heart reawakens after 
healing from suffering and heartbreak,” 

Artists Collective | Spartanburg, 
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for the community.” 
     Sue is an accomplished printmaker, hav-
ing exhibited her work across the US and 
in Asia. She currently teaches drawing and 
printmaking at USC Upstate. Locally she is 
active in the Contemporary Print Collective 
and also the Taiwan Society of Printmaking. 
She earned an MFA from SCAD Atlanta.   
     VAASE awards are made possible by gen-
erous contributions from the Metropolitan 
Arts Council with funds received from the 
City of Greenville, BMW Manufacturing 
Company, Michelin North America, Inc., 
SEW Eurodrive, and the South Carolina 
Arts Commission. In addition, this year’s 
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corporate sponsors include APCO Plas-
tics, Bennetts’ Frame & Art Gallery, Subur-
ban Paint, and the Greenville Tech Founda-
tion. Thank you all. 
     The Benson Campus Galleries are oper-
ated by and for the faculty and students of 
the Department of Visual Arts at Greenville 
Technical College. The galleries are located 
at 2522 Locust Hill Road, Greer. 
     For further information visit (www.
gvltec.edu/dva) or e-mail (fmarkel@gvltec.
edu), Fleming Markel, Gallery Director or 
(pat.owens@gvltec.edu), Patrick Owens, 
Gallery Assistant or call 864/250-3051.

$1,000.
     “Staying open later on Thursdays will 
make it easier for people - especially those 
who work during the day and whose week-
ends are filled - to shop with us and find 
their unique gifts,” Fedalei says. “While 
shoppers are at the Collective, they are en-
couraged to visit the other exhibitions in our 

galleries and to shop in our retail shop.”
     Beth Regula, chair of the management 
board of the Artists Collective, adds, “Our 
annual Holiday Artisan Market has become 
a favorite shopping spot for patrons looking 
for unique, locally made gifts for their loved 
ones. One might find what’s to become a 
favorite coffee mug, woolen scarf, necklace, 
earrings, serving dish, painting or print for 
a friend or relative - or even yourself. Shop-
ping at the Collective also bolsters the local 
economy. Everything that we sell is made 
by our members who live in Spartanburg 
and surrounding counties.”
      Items offered during the two-month 
market are replenished so there will always 
be plenty from which to choose, Fedalei 
adds. “Our artists are well prepared for this 
event. We have stocked up on some of the 
items that we believe will be popular this 
year. We encourage people to visit several 
times because there will always be some-
thing new on the tables.”
     Patrons also will be able to register for 
door prizes of gift certificates redeemable 
for merchandise at the Collective.
     Participating artists include: Monica 
Arledge, Teda Barrows, Chuck Bishop, 
Jordon Brown, Pat Cato, Kimberly Christo-
pher Rodriguez, B Collins, Robyn Craw-
ford, Patrick DeCrane, Craig Denesha, 
Andrew Donnan, Addam Duncan, Patrick 
Edwards, Marcy Fedalei, Logan “Divinity” 
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Foster, Peter Harding, Dan Hazard, Hannah 
“Jarfly” Henderson, Jason Huffman, Alyssa 
Jenkins, Thomas Koenig, Judith Kolva, 
Elliott Leader, John Lever, Judy Martin, 
Rosemary McLeod, Sydney McMath, Karin 
Patrick, Shannon Patrick, Ruza Pocivavsek, 
Beth Bullman Regula, Gale Roberts, Petra 
Romero, David Sawyer, Sandra Schindl-
beck, Anna Seiler, Mack Smith, Carol Story, 
Brandi Tucker, Jim Weber, Sally Weber, 
Joan Wheatley, Nancy Williamson and 
Patty Wright.
      The Artists Collective | Spartanburg, 
located on W. Main Street, provides a forum 
and home for the arts and creative popula-
tion of Spartanburg, providing facilities 
and services to artist members for exhibits, 
performances and creation.
     For further information check our SC 
Institutional Gallery listings or visit 
(artistscollectivespartanburg.org).

Lady Pluuto says, adding that she hopes 
people walk away with “a new perspective 
to always believe in the strength of their 
hearts.”
     She continues, “It’s about learning to 
heal through different forms of heartbreak. 
I am blessed to have another opportunity to 
display my work in a place that has played 
such an important role in my evolution.”
     Describing the works as “dreamy, ethere-
al and colorful,” she says, “Painting is more 
than just creating art for me, it’s therapy. I 
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H�iday  P��ery Sale 
Saturday, December 16th, 2023 

10 AM - 5 PM        

Two Studio Locations   
PK Pottery 

79 Wood Duck Drive,  Edgefield, SC  29824 (Off Hwy. 283) 
 

August & House 
102 Courthouse Square,  Edgefield, SC  29824 

 

https://m.facebook.com/edgefieldareaclayguild?mibextid=ZbWKwL&wtsid=rdr_0TOpOmgqjruzvQxmC

